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Tax deductible expenses and 
vacant properties 

The ability to deduct expenses incurred by a 
property business is determined by the status 
of that business. HMRC typically see a 
property business as fitting into one of the 
following categories: 

• Let on a commercial basis; 

• Let on an uncommercial basis; 

• Used for personal occupation; 

• Temporarily vacant; or 

• Ceased. 
If the property is being let on a commercial 
basis, the normal rules for expense deduction 
apply as per HMRC’s Property Income Manual 
(see link below). This factsheet looks at the 
other scenarios in more detail. 

‘Uncommercial’ letting 

A property is let on an uncommercial basis if 
the rents charged are less than the full market 
rent value or normal market lease conditions 
are not imposed.  

In this situation, only expenses up to the value 
of the rents received can be deducted; in other 
words, a loss cannot be created in respect of 
the property. Note that this does not apply for 
properties that are provided rent-free. If no 
rents are received, it means that any related 
expenses would not be incurred wholly and 
exclusively for business purposes and would 
therefore be disallowable. 

 

Property is used for personal 
occupation 

As expected, expenses that relate to a period 
when a property is used personally are not 
deductible because, quite simply, they are not 
incurred for business purposes. It is possible 
to treat a portion of an expense as deductible, 
but only if the business-use portion can be 
identified and calculated. For example, if over 
the course of a twelve-month buildings 
insurance policy the property was rented to 
tenants for five months and used personally 
for seven months, the cost of the policy could    
be time apportioned and 5/12 could be 
deducted. 

Property is temporarily vacant 

Expenses incurred during a period when the 
property is temporarily vacant can be 
deducted. Sometimes, it can be difficult to 
determine whether a property is temporarily 
vacant or the lettings business has, in fact, 
ceased. It’s an important distinction because 
the rules for post-cessation expenses apply if 
the business has ceased (see below). 

In the Property Income Manual, HMRC say 
that if the rental business consists of letting a 
single property, it will not normally cease just 
because the tenant quits and the property is 
empty while the landlord is looking for a new 
tenant. HMRC also say that, in practice, they 
will not normally suggest that the old business 
stopped where the gap is less than three years 
and the customer was trying to continue. 

The property business has ceased 

Usually a rental business ceases when the last 
let property is disposed of or starts to be used 
for some other purpose. 

Post-cessation expenses can be deducted if 
they would have been allowable had the 
business continued, for example, the cost of 
background heating for empty premises to 
keep down condensation and so maintain the 
value of the property for later sale. 

In addition, relief for certain post-cessation 
expenses such as bad debts and legal fees 
can be claimed if they were incurred within 
seven years of the business ceasing. 

Further information 

General information on deductible property 
expenses can be found in HMRC’s Property 
Income Manual: https://www.gov.uk/hmrc-
internal-manuals/property-income-
manual/pim1900 

More information on post-cessation receipts 
and expenses can be found 
here:https://www.gov.uk/hmrc-internal-
manuals/property-income-manual/pim2500 
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